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Sermons for Children - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.
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Sermons to Children - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Sermons for Children - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Children's Story Sermons - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Catholic Sermons for Children... - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

The Two Bears, and Other Sermons for Children - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 



stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Sunny Windows

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

The Children's Great Texts of the Bible - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Village Sermons and Town and Country Sermons - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Sermons on National Subjects - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 



believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

The Childrens Great Texts of the Bible - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Town and Country Sermons - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

God and Little Children

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

All Saints Day and Other Sermons - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Discipline and Other Sermons - Scholar's Choice Edition



This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Come Ye Children - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Children's Story-sermons

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

The Good News of God - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Westminster Sermons - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 



and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work. As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Children's Gospel Story-sermons

Excerpt from Children's Gospel Story-Sermons These are Story Sermons. They are not stories and 
must not be so judged. Some times they tag a moral to a tale. They are not sermons and must 
not be tested by the one, two, three method of the classroom or the pulpit. Simplicity has been 
aimed at but the great central doctrines of the Christian faith have not been neglected. About the 
Publisher Forgotten Books publishes hundreds of thousands of rare and classic books. Find more at 
www.forgottenbooks.com This book is a reproduction of an important historical work. Forgotten Books 
uses state-of-the-art technology to digitally reconstruct the work, preserving the original format whilst 
repairing imperfections present in the aged copy. In rare cases, an imperfection in the original, such as 
a blemish or missing page, may be replicated in our edition. We do, however, repair the vast majority 
of imperfections successfully; any imperfections that remain are intentionally left to preserve the state 
of such historical works.

CHILDRENS STORY-SERMONS

Trieste Publishing has a massive catalogue of classic book titles. Our aim is to provide readers with 
the highest quality reproductions of fiction and non-fiction literature that has stood the test of time. The 
many thousands of books in our collection have been sourced from libraries and private collections 
around the world.The titles that Trieste Publishing has chosen to be part of the collection have been 
scanned to simulate the original. Our readers see the books the same way that their first readers did 
decades or a hundred or more years ago. Books from that period are often spoiled by imperfections 
that did not exist in the original. Imperfections could be in the form of blurred text, photographs, or 
missing pages. It is highly unlikely that this would occur with one of our books. Our extensive quality 
control ensures that the readers of Trieste Publishing's books will be delighted with their purchase. Our 
staff has thoroughly reviewed every page of all the books in the collection, repairing, or if necessary, 
rejecting titles that are not of the highest quality. This process ensures that the reader of one of Trieste 
Publishing's titles receives a volume that faithfully reproduces the original, and to the maximum degree 
possible, gives them the experience of owning the original work.We pride ourselves on not only creating 
a pathway to an extensive reservoir of books of the finest quality, but also providing value to every one 
of our readers. Generally, Trieste books are purchased singly - on demand, however they may also be 
purchased in bulk. Readers interested in bulk purchases are invited to contact us directly to enquire 
about our tailored bulk rates.

Children's Gospel Story-Sermons (Classic Reprint)

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

One Hundred Choice Sermons for Children

Excerpt from Children's Story-Sermons I wish to express my indebtedness to my friend Prof. Thomas 
C. Blaisdell, Ph. D of the Michigan Agricultural College for his many helpful suggestions. About the 
Publisher Forgotten Books publishes hundreds of thousands of rare and classic books. Find more at 



www.forgottenbooks.com This book is a reproduction of an important historical work. Forgotten Books 
uses state-of-the-art technology to digitally reconstruct the work, preserving the original format whilst 
repairing imperfections present in the aged copy. In rare cases, an imperfection in the original, such as 
a blemish or missing page, may be replicated in our edition. We do, however, repair the vast majority 
of imperfections successfully; any imperfections that remain are intentionally left to preserve the state 
of such historical works.

Children's Story-Sermons

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

The Conversion of Children - Scholar's Choice Edition

The kindly reception given to the two preceding volumes, "Children's Story Sermons" and "Children's 
Missionary Story Sermons," together with the persuasive insistence of the children and their friends, 
have led to the publication of this volume of "Children's Gospel Story Sermons." During the past few 
years there has been an encouraging increase in the publication of religious literature for children. It is 
impossible to exaggerate the value and importance of meeting a need that is obvious to all who think. 
The danger is that those who attempt to meet the need may miss the mark. These are Story Sermons. 
They are not stories and must not be so judged. Sometimes they "tag a moral to a tale." They are not 
sermons and must not be tested by the one, two, three method of the classroom or the pulpit. Simplicity 
has been aimed at but the great central doctrines of the Christian faith have not been neglected. Sir 
James Barrie in "The Little Minister" says that the first question always asked of the child in his day was 
not, "What is your name?" but "What are you going to be?" and that one child in every family replied, 
"A minister." If this volume succeeds in interesting one outstanding boy to become a minister who will 
preach better Story Sermons than these, the purpose of this book will have been secured, H. T. K. 
Pittsburgh, Pa.

Sermons to Children

Perfect for family reading time or as a resource for Sunday school lessons, Story Sermons for Children 
contains a collection of charming and insightful sermons aimed at teaching young children the value 
of a virtuous life based on Christ's teachings. Each sermon is presented in the form of a charming 
story that young readers are sure to find engaging. This work has been selected by scholars as being 
culturally important, and is part of the knowledge base of civilization as we know it. This work is in the 
"public domain in the United States of America, and possibly other nations. Within the United States, 
you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright 
on the body of the work. Scholars believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be 
preserved, reproduced, and made generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the 
preservation process, and thank you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and 
relevant.

Children's Story-Sermons (Classic Reprint)

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 



artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

Come and Welcome to Jesus Christ - Scholar's Choice Edition

This work has been selected by scholars as being culturally important, and is part of the knowledge 
base of civilization as we know it. This work was reproduced from the original artifact, and remains as 
true to the original work as possible. Therefore, you will see the original copyright references, library 
stamps (as most of these works have been housed in our most important libraries around the world), 
and other notations in the work. This work is in the public domain in the United States of America, and 
possibly other nations. Within the United States, you may freely copy and distribute this work, as no 
entity (individual or corporate) has a copyright on the body of the work.As a reproduction of a historical 
artifact, this work may contain missing or blurred pages, poor pictures, errant marks, etc. Scholars 
believe, and we concur, that this work is important enough to be preserved, reproduced, and made 
generally available to the public. We appreciate your support of the preservation process, and thank 
you for being an important part of keeping this knowledge alive and relevant.

A Glance Into the Kingdom of Grace

This scarce antiquarian book is a facsimile reprint of the original. Due to its age, it may contain 
imperfections such as marks, notations, marginalia and flawed pages. Because we believe this work 
is culturally important, we have made it available as part of our commitment for protecting, preserving, 
and promoting the world's literature in affordable, high quality, modern editions that are true to the 
original work.

Sermons Preached in English Churches

Children's Gospel Story-Sermons
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